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l.nkar Wakale <omkar.wakale@lifesenz.co.in> Mon, Aug 12,2024 at 4:41
ir: puja vyawhare chinchole <vyawharepooja@gmail.com>
)':: Bharti Rathod <bharti.rathod@lifesenz.co.in>, Anjali Rai <anjali.rai@ocp.edu.in>, lnfo Life Senz <info@lifesenz.co.in>,
:ajasekaran R <rajasekaran.r@lifesenz.co.in>, Sudha Rathod <sudharathod@gmail.com>, "Arindam Barf,rjee ph.D."
arindam.banerjee@lifesenz.co.in>, Aishwarya Katkar <pharma.aishwarya0l @gmail.com>

Dear Puja
PFA the Raw data & Report for the remaining assays
Thanks & Regards
Omkar Wakale
Research assistant
LifeSenz Cancer Research Labs Pvt Ltd
Mumbai400080
r,vww"lifesenz.ca.in

,.[Quoted text hidden]

:' 3 attachments

Puja MTT Report & Raw data.xlsx
1 03K

r- Puja Report.pdf
621K

Raw Datir images.pptx
13147K

,. rja vyawhare chinchole <vyawharepooja@gmail.com>
, .: Om kar Wakale <om kar.wakale@lifesenz. co. in>

Mon, Aug 12,2024 at 10:02 F

' ;: Bharti Rathod <bharti.rathod@lifesenz.co.in>_, Anjali Rai <anjali.rai@ocp.edu.in>, lnfo Life Senz <info@lifesenz.co.in>,
rajasekaran R <rajasekaran.r@lifesenz.co.in>, Sudha Rathod <sudharathod@gmaii.com>, ,'Arindam Ban-erjee ph.D."
,rrindam.banerjee@lifesenz.co.in>, Aishwarya Katkar <pharma.aishwaryaol6-gmail.com,

Thanks, team Lifesenz, for the report. please provide me the quotation in the name of Oriental college of pharmacy.

iQuoted text hiddenl

i rdha Rathod <sudharathod@gmail.com>
i : anjali.rai@ocp.edu.in
.i

Dr.Sudha Rathod
,.M. Pharm, Ph.D (Tech)
Principal
Oriental College of Pharmacy,
Plot No. 3,4,5 Sector 2, Near Sanpada Railway Station,
Sanpada, Navi Mumbai.
Contact No. 9769000309

Mon, Aug 26,2024 at 3:45 F

Dr. (t\rt!rs.)
Princin:!

From: Omkar Wakale <omkar.wakale@li{esenz.co.in> ;;;;,.i; -.' ,: .. .- 
'

Date: Sat, Au924,2024 at 10:3BAM I 'vr .'i(i' r' -'' r'
. subject: Re: confirmation Regarding Repetition studies sanpa:::', i'i:,' ''' "':" ' . '

,.lo: pula vyawttare chinchole <vyawharbpooja@gmail.com>, Sudha Rathod <sudharathocl@gmail.com>
, Cc:.Arindam Banerjee Ph.D. <arindam.banerjeeplifesenz.co.in>, Anisha Bhende <anisha.bhende@lifesenz.co.in>,
.<rajasekaran.r@iifesenz.co.in>, Bharti Rathod <,bharti.rathod@lifesenz.co.in>

Dear Puja
PFA all the quotations for the study in name of oriental college of pharmacy

Thanks & Regards
Omkar Wakale
Rocaarnh acciqtant

Rajasekaran R

..ili I \.'_l .,i.'



Mumbai400080
www.lifesenz.co.in

[Quoted text hidden]

4 attachments

;1 Puja Quotation Repeat Studies.pdfr 29gK

*1 Puja lnitial Studies quotation.pdf
i--r 305K

.-1 Puja Comparitive study quotation.pdfI gosx

-,1 Puja quotation 4.pdf
"-J 306K

i'rdha Rathod <sudharathod@gmail.com>
; r: anjali.rai@ocp.edu.in

'Dr.Sudha 
Rathod

M. Pharm, Ph.D (Tech)

f 'cipal
C,,cntal College of Pharmacy,
Plot No. 3,4,5 Sector 2, Near Sanpada Railway Station,
Sanpada, Navl Mumbai.
Contact No. 9769000309

Mon, Aug 26,2024 at 3:46 F

Forwarded message
From: Omkar Wakale <omkar.wakale@lifesenz.co.in>
Date: Sat, Aug 24, 2024 at 10:38 AM
Subject: Re: Confirmation Regarding Repetition Siudies
To: puja vyawhare chinchole <vya'"vlrarepooja@gnrail.com>, Sudha Rathod <sudharathod@gmail.com>
Cc:Arindam Banerjee Ph.D. <arindam.banerjee@lifesenz"co.in>, Anisha Bhende <anisha.6'tiende@lifesenz.co.in>, Rajasekaran R<rajasekaran.r@lifesenz.co.in>, Bharti Rathod <bharti.rathod@liiesenz.co.in>

Dear Puja
PFA all the quotations for the study in name of oriental college of pharmacy

Tf'-nks & Regards
O, .ar Wakale
Research assistant
LifeSenz Cancer Research Labs pvt Ltd
Mumbai400080
www.lifesenz.co.in

iQuoted text hiddenl

4 attachments

E #6?,nrotation 
RePeat Studies.pdf

g1 Puja lnitial Studies quotation.pdf
- 305K

;p Puja Gomparitive study quotation.pdfu 3o5K

g3 Puja quotation 4.pdfu 3o6K

Dr. (tu!rs.)
Principel
Oriefitt! Ci.'1'r-.' ,' ';::taqf
Fict ['j':" 3, ,'. :,', ,'- - .: :'-2.
Sanpiil::r, i.,l:::,'i ;',,:..,,.-,r,i-

/-]r''
Sudha Rathod

,6\
\4\,
rVri'
!<

tSlt

i rdha Rathod <sudharathod@gmail.com>
r : anjali.rai@ocp.edu.in

Mon, Aug 26,2024 at 3:46 F



Principal'Oriental 
College of Pharmacy,

Plot No. 3,4,5 Sector 2, Near Sanpada Railway Station,
Sanpada, Navi Mumbai.
Contact No. 9769000309

Forwarded message
From : Omkar Wakale <omkar.wakale@lifesenz.co.in>
Date: Mon, Aug 12, 2024 at 4:41 PM
Subject: Re: Confirmation Regarding Repetition Studies
To: puja vyawhare chinchole <vyawharepooja@gmail.com>
[Quoted text hidden]

iQuoted text hiddenl ,

3 attachments

Puja MTT Report & Raw data.xlsx
1 03K

Puja Report.pdf
621K

Raw Data images.pptx
13147K
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; nkar Wakale <omkar.wakale@lifesenz.co.in> Thu, Nov 28, ZO24 at 4:38 F,: puja vyawhaie ch i nchole <vyiwharepooja@g mai l.com>' ;: Sudha Rathod <sudharathod@gmail.com>, "Arindam Banerjee Ph.D." <arindam.banerjee@lifesenz.co.in>, Anisha Bhende
tnisha'bhende@lifesenz.co.in>, Rajasekaran R <rajasekaran.r@lifesenz.co.in>, ahlarti nitlr; <bharti.rathodplifesenz.co.in>, AnjaI li <anjali.rai@ocp.edu.in>

Dear Puja,

We have received a payment of {29,526 today (28-'ll -2024). Below is the summary of the payment details:

, . TotalAmount: t63,157
. Amount Paid: {50,460
. Pending Amount: <12,697

To provide better clarity, I've also included an Excel sheet outlining the specifics and differences of the experiments.
:Additionally, the following payments remain pending:

1. t5,409 for toxicity studies (euotation No. 215).
2. <7,288 for the MTT Assay (euotation No. 136), named for Vinayak Dubey.

We kindly request you to settle the outstanding amount at your earliest convenience. If we've missed any payment, please sharethe receipt for our reference.

Please find both the quotations attached for your review.

Thanks & Regards
Omkar Wakale
Research assistant
LifeSenz Cancer Research Labs pvt Ltd
Mumbai400080
www'lifesenz.co.in

On Fri, Nov 8, 2024 al ll:13AM puja vyawhare chinchole <vyawharepoaja@gmail.cont> wrote:

Good morning sir
I'll check and do payment within week sorry for inconvenience caused.

on wed, 6 Nov, 2024, 4:40 pm omkar wakale, <or:kar.wakale@llfesenz.co.in> wrote:

Dear Puja,

I hope this message finds you well.

L4/
Dr. (Mrs.)6udha Rathod
Prhcipal
Oriental Collcge ci :,:.r;nac,
Plot No. 3, 4 & S, '.. i i:i-2,
Sanpada, Navi i';iuri:rr1.



experlments' As all the experiments have been completed and the reports have been dispatched, we kindly request you tosettle the outstanding amount at your earliest convenience.

Here are the payment details for your reference:

. TotalAmount: t 63,157. Amount Paid: { 20,934. Pending Amount: < 42,223

Additionally, I have included an Excel sheet that outlines the specifics and differences of the experiments for better clarity.

Payment Details :

NEFT/RTGS. DETAILS
NAME. LIFESENZ CANCER RESEARCH LABS PVT. LTD.
BANK NAME -YES BANK
ACCOUNT NO - 123963300000072
IFSC CODE - YESBOOO1239
BRANCH - PANCHPAKADI, THANE
A/C TYPE - CURRENTACCOUNT
Please share the transaction details once completed.
Google Pay scan bar is attached.

, lf you have already made the payment, please share the payment receipt with us.

' Looking forward to receiving a positive reply from your end.
Thanks & Regards
Omkar Wakale
Research assistant
LifeSenz Oancer Research Labs pvt Ltd
Mumbai400080
www.lifesenz.co.in

on Sun, Aug 25, 2024 al8:07 PM puja vyawhare chinchole <vyawharepooja@gnrail.com> wrote:

Dear team
Please consider my earlier payment details

on sat, 24 Au},2024, 10:38 am omkar wakare, <cn:kar.lvakare@rifesenz.co.in> wrote:
Dear Puja
PFA all the quotations for the study in name of oriental coilege of pharmacy
[Quoted text hidden]

[Quoted text hidclen]

3 attachments
J

?1

ffi

21 5_ Prot. Puja toxicity studies.pdf
407K

Vinayak Quotation.pdf
332K

Prof.Puja Payment details.xlsx
11K

hA/
Bfilllf') sudha Rathod

',,':f
.:t

,'rja vyawhare chinchole <vyawharepooja@gmail.com> --"- 
;, ;i.: omkar wakare <omkar.waiare@rifesenzio.in> Fri, Nov 29,2024 at3:12 F

);: sudha Rathod <sudharathod@gmail.com>, "Arindam Banerjee Ph.D." <arindam.banerjee@lifesenz.co.in>, Anisha Bhende

' i:ffji,H$g[:::T:o'in>, R-alasekaran R 
'rajasekaran.r'6lifu.unr."o.in', ehr;i nitoo <bharti.rathodptifesenz.co.in>, Anja

Dear team
only {7,288 for the MTT Assay (Quotation No. 136), named for Vinayak Dubey. is pending. I,ll pay this next week.[Quoted text hidden]

'(

P,cl ..1;.., l. ., ,l
Sanpeda,'f4:,.,
















